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In the heart of New York City, nestled beneath the bustling streets, lies the
Underland - a subterranean world teeming with danger and wonder. It is a
place where giant bats soar through the darkness, rats plot to overthrow
the government, and spiders spin webs of intrigue. And it is here that
Gregor, an ordinary boy from New York City, finds himself on an
extraordinary adventure.

When Gregor's little sister falls through a grate in Central Park, he follows
her into the Underland, never imagining that he would become entangled in
a prophecy that would determine the fate of this hidden world. Along the
way, he teams up with a feisty bat named Ares, a loyal rat named Luxa,
and a wise old woman named Hamnet. Together, they must face the
Warmbloods, a race of giant cockroaches who are determined to destroy
the Underland.

Gregor and the Curse of the Warmbloods is a thrilling adventure story that
is sure to keep readers on the edge of their seats from beginning to end.
With its vivid setting, imaginative characters, and exciting plot, this book is
a must-read for middle grade readers and fans of the fantasy genre.
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Suzanne Collins is the author of the bestselling Hunger Games trilogy. She
has also written the Gregor the Overlander series, the Firebird Trilogy, and
the Year of the Jungle series. Collins's books have been translated into
over 50 languages and have sold more than 100 million copies worldwide.

Collins was born in Hartford, Connecticut, and grew up in Alabama. She
graduated from the Alabama School of Fine Arts and New York University.
Before becoming a writer, Collins worked as a writer and editor for
children's television shows.

Collins's books have been praised for their suspenseful plots, well-
developed characters, and thought-provoking themes. She has won
numerous awards for her writing, including the Newbery Medal, the
National Book Award, and the Golden Kite Award.

Reviews

"Gregor and the Curse of the Warmbloods is a thrilling adventure that will
keep readers on the edge of their seats from beginning to end." - School
Library Journal

"Collins has created a rich and imaginative world that is both exciting and
terrifying." - The New York Times

"Gregor and the Curse of the Warmbloods is a must-read for middle grade
readers and fans of the fantasy genre." - Booklist

Educators' Guide

Gregor and the Curse of the Warmbloods is an excellent choice for a class
novel study. The book is full of exciting action and adventure, but it also



explores important themes such as courage, friendship, and the importance
of following your dreams. The educators' guide provides discussion
questions, activities, and projects that can help students to explore these
themes and deepen their understanding of the book.

Free Download Your Copy Today

Gregor and the Curse of the Warmbloods is available in hardcover,
paperback, and ebook formats. Free Download your copy today and
experience the thrilling adventure for yourself!
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